
 

 
OUR PARISH WORKS FOR GOD 

 

 
PARISH FINANCES - To meet our budgeted ex-
penses for the fiscal year the sum of $8,911.00 is 
needed on an average basis in the Sunday collection. 
 

October 6-7, 2018 
227 Envelopes out of 607 collected $         6,838.00 
       Loose Collection                       $           407.35 
       Children’s Envelopes              $             62.03 
                              Total Gifts to God         $         7,307.38 
 

Balance for the week  . . . . . . . . . . . .   $      (1,603.62) 
 
 

CALENDAR 

 

RITE OF CHRISTIAN INITIATION OF 
ADULTS (RCIA)  -   Next class will be Tuesday, 
October 16 with the topic “The Holy Spirit” instructed 
by Henry Reese. 
 

RELIGIOUS EDUCATION  -  Class will be held 
Sunday, October 14 for students in pre-school through 
grade 8. 
 

APPLE DUMPLINGS will be sold October 13  -  14 
after Masses. Proceeds benefit the Holy Trinity Choir. 
   

COFFEE SOCIAL  -  The second Sunday of each 
month, a different parish organization will provide cof-
fee and doughnuts for our parishioners and guests in 
the parish hall between the 8 a.m. and 10:30 a.m. 
Sunday Masses. The Parish Pastoral Council will kick 
off this ministry of hospitality after the 8 a.m. Mass 
Sunday, October 14. 
 

300 CLUB  -  The final drawing and party will be 
held Sunday, October 14 at 4:00 p.m. in the parish 
center.  

 
BUILDING AND GROUNDS COMMITTEE will 
meet on Friday, October 19th at 9:00 A.M. in the  
rectory dining room. 
 

ARCHIVE COMMITTEE  -  If you are interested in 
preserving the history of Holy Trinity Church, please 
consider joining the Archive Committee. For more in-
formation, call the parish office at (717)684-2711. The 
next meeting will be Friday, October 26 at 1:00 in the 
Rectory basement.  
 
 
 

 
OUR PARISH PRAYS 

 

MASS INTENTIONS FOR THE WEEK 
 
 

SATURDAY, October 13 
  5:00 P.M.       Esther Meisenbach 
                         
SUNDAY, October 14 
   8:00 A.M.      Kathy Doutrich  
 10:30 A.M.      Peg Deascenti 
 
MONDAY, October 15 
 7:30 A.M.   Margaret Weisser 
 
TUESDAY, October 16 
 7:30 A.M.  Paul Nikolaus 
 
WEDNESDAY, October 17 
 7:30 A.M.  Edith Kauffman 
 
THURSDAY, October 18 
 7:30 A.M.  Michael Bronokoski 
 
FRIDAY, October 19 
 8:15 A.M.   Susan Smtih 
             
 SATURDAY, October 20 
  8:00 A.M.       Diane Zeamer 
  5:00 P.M.       August Schulz 
                                   
SUNDAY,  October 21 
   8:00 A.M.     Cleaona Mesenbach 
  10:30 A.M.    People of the Parish 
 
                          

28th SUNDAY in ORDINARY TIME  

OCTOBER 14, 2018 



 
  

MISCELLANEOUS 
 

 
VOCATION CROSS  

this week is in the home of  
 
 
 

 
FLOWERS on the Altar tthis weekend have been 
placed there in memory of  Mary Morrison. 

 

LEBANON VA VISIT  -  The Knights of Columbus  
will be visiting the Lebanon VA hospital to entertain 
our veterans on Tuesday, October 23. Donations of 
individual size drinks and snacks are needed. Please 
drop them off at the home before  Saturday, October 
20. If anyone is interested in volunteering that night, 
please meet us at the home at 5:30 p.m. If you can 
be there, contact Steve Nikolaus (717) 684-2985. 

 
“THAT MAN IS YOU”  -  That Man is You! men’s 
group will meet on Saturday, October 20 in the St. 
Peter Parish Center, downstairs. The topic for this 
week is “Joyful Service.” Men of the parish are invited 
to join their brothers from St. Peter’s and other local 
churches on a spiritual journey that will lead them to 
the three spiritual foods that Christ proclaims: The 
Eucharist, The Word of God and The Will of God. 
Sessions begin at 6:30 a.m. and conclude at 7:45 
a.m. For more information, contact Paul Resch at 
(717) 449-00586 or paulresch@comcast.net 
 

ALL SAINTS' DAY - Thursday, November 1 is 
the Holy Day of Obligation of the Solemnity of All 
Saints' Day, celebrating all the known and unknown 
saints of heaven. Mass will be offered Wednesday, 
October 31 at 6:30 p.m., and Thursday, November 1 
at 9:00 a.m. and 6:30 p.m. 
 

ALL SOULS' DAY - Friday, November 2 is the 
Commemoration of All the Faithful Departed. A me-
morial service will be held in the cemetery chapel at 
noon to pray for all who those who died from our par-
ish or were buried in our cemetery in the last year.  
 

COLUMBIA KOC LADIES’ AUXILIIARY is hav-
ing a Ladies’ Night Open House to recruit new mem-
bers. It will be held Friday, October 19. We will have 
snacks and lite fare available. If you know someone 
who would like to join our Auxiliary, please bring them  
along. 
 
 

 
 
HOLY TRINITY PRO-LIFE COMMITTEE  -  Our 
parish is looking to form a committee to (1) find out 
about and promote pro-life activities going on around 
us, (2) to increase the awareness of the Catholic pro-
life message, and (3) to potentially create and host 
pro-life awareness events. Please contact Bonnie 
Schmitt at (717) 951-5492 or the parish office if you 
are interested in being part of this work of evangeliza-
tion for the protection of the most vulnerable among  
us.  
 
WING NIGHT will be at the Knights of Columbus 
Thursday, October 18 5:30-7:30 p.m. There will be a 
limited menu of freshly fried chicken wings in your 
choice of 4 flavors, along with fried shrimp, French 
fries, pizza, and chicken tenders.  
 

LITITZ 5K FOR LIFE  -  Saint James Catholic 
Church’s Respect Life Committee is hosting the Third 
Annual Lititz 5K for Life on Saturday, October 20. Pro-
ceeds will benefit 3 Lancaster County Pro-Life Minis-
tries: A Women’s Concern, Family of Restorative Min-
istries, and North Star Initiative. This event is for both 
walkers and runners and will begin and end at St. 
James Catholic Church, 505 Woodcrest Ave., Lititz. 
For more information and online registration go to 
www.pretzelcitysports.com. For questions contact  
Kara Garman at (717) 575-7072 or gellie@ptd.net. 
 

LANCASTER’S NINTH 40 DAYS FOR LIFE 
runs from 10:00 a.m. to 4:00 p.m. each Monday, 
Wednesday and Thursday from September 26th  -  
November 4th on the public sidewalk in front of Lan-
caster’s Planned Parenthood (PP) facility. While abor-
tions are currently barred in Lancaster, over 500 wom-
en from our County still get them at PP facilities in 
neighboring counties. To learn more and get involved, 
please contact Dave Edgar at 717-569-7677 or Tom 
Ramsbottom at 717-468-3822. 
 

CROSS CATHOLIC OUTREACH Is an interna-
tional Catholic organization with pontifical approval for 
preaching and collecting for the needs of those in mis-
sionary territories. Fr. Richard Kunzman will be visiting 
our parish the weekend of October 20-21. He will be 
celebrating the Sacrament of Reconciliation and serv-
ing as the priest for our parish masses that weekend, 
and will have brochures to explain the ministry of 
Cross Catholic Outreach. Let us welcome Fr. Kunz-
man, and share our generosity with those most in 
need throughout the world.   



 
RAISE A GLASS TO RAISE THE ROOF  -  
Please join us to “Raise a Glass to Raise the Roof”  —  
a wine-tasting event to benefit St. Anne Church in 
Lancaster on Saturday, November 17 from 6:00-10:00 
p.m. at the Emerald Foundation Facility (former Jew-
ish community center), 2120 Oregon Pike, Lancaster. 
An informative tasting of selected Italian wines paired 
with delicious ‘heavy’ hors d’oeuvres will be the high-
light of the evening. Tom Fertal, the Barstool Catholic, 
will entertain and emcee the event. To make a reser-
vation, please visit the St. Anne Parish website at: 
www.stannechurch.org for a link to the reservation 
form. Cost is $50 per person and checks should be 
made payable to St. Anne Church, 929 North Duke 
St., Lancaster, PA 17602. 
 
RETREAT: A TIME APART WITH JESUS  -  
On Friday, November 2, Our Lady’s Missionaries of 
the Eucharist invites you to a special retreat. The re-
treat is offered by Sister Joan Noreen, Co-founder of 
OLME and EWTN Host of “Eucharistic Journey” at 
Ave Maria Retreat House in Doylestown, PA. This re-
treat includes Daily Eucharistic adoration, conference 
on Catholic Spirituality, Prayer with Sacred Scripture, 
Liturgy of the Hours, and much more. For more  
information, please contact Our Lady’s Missionaries of 
the Eucharist office  olme@olme.org or (610) 582-
3333 

 
OUR LADY OF THE ANGELS SCHOOL 

 
LCHS UNIFORM EXCHANGE  -  Our Lady of the 
Angels will be starting a uniform exchange for LCHS 
students. At this present time we do not have stock of 
any uniforms. Please feel free to drop off any gently 
worn LCHS uniforms to the school office. Spread the 
word to all those LCHS families.  

 
THE ANGELS AMONG US GALA will be held on 
January 12, 2019. During the Gala, we will be honor-
ing our Hall of Fame recipients; Deacon Jeffrey Baylor 
& Bernie Wolgemuth Jr. To request your invitation, 
contact Mandee Havrilla at (717) 449-5442 or email 
msahd-havrilla@ourladyoftheangels.org. 
 

LANCASTER CATHOLIC HIGH SCHOOL 
 
OPEN HOUSE  -  Who can you become in our  
colors? Our annual Open House will take place on 
Sunday, October 28 from 2:30-4:30 P.M. This is a 
unique opportunity to tour Lancaster Catholic with one 
of our students, observe our faculty and students in 
classroom activities, and enjoy performances from a 
variety of student ensembles. Register 
www.lchsyes.org/open/. 

 
 

 
DIOCESE OF HARRISBURG 

 
4th ANNUAL WOMEN’S CONFERENCE - 
Registration is available at www.hgbdiocese.org/
women. Mark your calendar for the 4th Annual Dio-
cese of Harrisburg Women’s Conference on Satur-
day, October 20th, 2018, at Bishop McDevitt High 
School. There will be 30+ workshops, Eucharistic 
Holy Hour, and Mass with Bishop Gainer.  Keynote 
speaker will be Jennifer Fulwiler, writer, speaker, and 
host of her own national radio program.  The theme 
this year is “Women of Life and Love: Celebrating the 
Beauty of Humanae Vitae.” We are hoping for 1,000 
women strong this year! 
 

THE HARRISBURG CURSILLO MOVEMENT 
invites you to GRAND ULTREYA on Saturday, Octo-
ber 27 from 9 a.m.  -  3 p.m. at the Diocesan Confer-
ence Center, 4800 Union Deposit Road, Harrisburg 
PA. Doors will open at 8 a.m. and Mass will begin at 
9:15 a.m. with Bishop Gainer as main celebrant. Cur-
sillistas, come share in this once-a-year event. If you 
have not made a weekend yet, come learn about 
Cursillo. REGISTER BY OCTOBER 22nd. Suggested 
donation is $15.00 and includes lunch. For info, con-
tact Roseann Gurrini at:: Rose52g@comcast.net or 
(717)248-4328. Send checks payable to “Harrisburg 
Cursillo Movement” to: 409 Oak Ridge Road, Lewis-
town, PA 17044, or pay at the door. Bring your spir-
itual books for the book swap.  
 
 

CATHOLIC CHARITIES DINNER - Save the 
date for the annual Catholic Charities Come and See 
Dinner, which will take place on Monday, October 
22nd at 5:00 p.m. at the Cardinal Keeler Center in 
Harrisburg.  Kevin Reilly, an acclaimed motivational 
speaker, author, and former professional football 
player with the Philadelphia Eagles and New England 
Patriots, will be the guest speaker. The evening in-
cludes a reception, silent and chance auctions, buffet 
dinner, and remarks from Mr. Reilly as well as Bishop 
Gainer.  Proceeds from the event benefit the Catholic 
Charities Home for Healing, Evergreen House,  
Interfaith Shelter for homeless families, and 
Lourdeshouse maternity home. For more information, 
contact Christopher Meehan at cmehan@cchbg.org 
or 717-657-4804. 
 
 
 


